DESOTO COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

BOARD MEETING MINUTES

Bill russell, PRESIDENT 2007 PRESIDING

October 1, 2007 
A.  CALL TO ORDER
The October 1, 2007, meeting of the DeSoto County Board of Supervisors was called to order by Supervisor Bill Russell, Board President.

Chief Deputy Charlie Brown of the DeSoto County Sheriff’s Department was present and did open the
DeSoto County Board of Supervisors meeting in a regular session to hear any and all business to come before the Board.  The following were present:

    


Supervisor Jessie Medlin------------------District 1




Supervisor Eugene C. Thach-------------District 2




Supervisor Bill Russell--------------------District 3





Supervisor Allen Latimer-----------------District 4





Supervisor Tommy Lewis----------------District 5 




W. E. Sluggo Davis------------------------Chancery Clerk




Michael Garriga----------------------------County Administrator




Tony Nowak--------------------------------Board Attorney




Chief Deputy Charlie Brown-------------Sheriff’s Department

B.  INVOCATION

Supervisor Eugene Thach presented the invocation.

C.  PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

D.  APPROVAL OF SEPTEMBER MINUTES 

The official minutes of the Board of Supervisors were read for the month of September, 2007, pursuant to Section 19-3-27 of the Mississippi Code of 1972, Annotated.  Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Jessie Medlin seconded the motion to approve the minutes of the Board of Supervisors, for the month of September 2007, which require a clarification on the Executive Session minutes for September 5, 2007, by Supervisor Tommy Lewis, and require a clarification made by Supervisor Allen Latimer to the September 4, 2007 minutes regarding titles and tags for utility trailers.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.
E.  CONSENT AGENDA

The Board of Supervisors considered approval of the Consent Agenda as presented.  
Supervisor Tommy Lewis said he is still struggling with inventory dispositions.  He said the inventory dispositions that indicate they were disposed of by employees should include an affidavit from the employee.  


Supervisor Eugene Thach made the motion and Supervisor Tommy Lewis seconded the motion to approve the Consent Agenda items as follows and to hold over the Inventory Dispositions until October 3, 2007:


1.  Accounting 




a. Ratification of Monthly Health Claims
	The following is a recap of all insurance claims funded for the month of September and paid to Humana:

	
	
	
	
	

	Funding Request
	Date Paid
	Amount
	Claim Type
	

	Date
	 
	 
	 
	

	9/1/07
	9/4/07
	$69,154.90
	Admin Fees
	

	9/4/07
	9/5/07
	$73,965.63
	Medical
	 

	9/4/07
	9/5/07
	$4,748.00
	Dental 
	

	9/10/07
	9/11/07
	$44,760.04
	Medical
	

	9/10/07
	9/11/07
	$4,383.65
	Dental 
	

	9/17/07
	9/18/07
	$43,573.32
	Medical
	

	9/17/07
	9/18/07
	$5,521.43
	Dental 
	

	9/24/07
	9/25/07
	$26,515.69
	Medical
	

	9/24/07
	9/25/07
	$4,382.50
	Dental 
	

	9/24/07
	9/25/07
	$70,565.08
	Prescriptions
	

	 
	 
	 
	 
	

	 
	TOTAL
	$347,570.24
	 
	

	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	

	September Book Balance
	$3,566,170.25
	 
	

	August Book Balance
	$3,677,455.13
	 
	

	July Book Balance
	 
	$3,603,162.04
	 
	

	June Book Balance
	 
	$3,564,033.30
	 
	

	May Book Balance
	 
	$3,532,141.05
	 
	

	April Book Balance
	 
	$3,569,844.77
	 
	



b. Approval for Interfund Loan




From:

General County Fund















001-000-054



$550,000.00




To:



2003  9.3 mil. Refunding Bonds I & S




221-000-149



$550,000.00

c. Quarterly Budget Allocations

October 1, 2007

QUARTERLY BUDGET ALLOCATIONS

For Quarter Ending December 31, 2007

TAX ASSESSOR:

Department 103……………………………………....$323,574.75

TAX COLLECTOR:

Department 104……………………………………….$304,382.50

SHERIFF:

Department 200 (Sheriff Administration)……………$   207,769.25

Department 201 (Aviation)……………………….....$      14,045.00

Department 202 (Patrol/Law Enforcement)……….…$ 1,845,648.00

Department 220 (Custody of Prisoners)………….….$     869,831.75

Department 222 (Prisoners’ Medical Expense)….… $      297,759.75

Department 223 (Juvenile Detention)………………...$   200,525.00

Department 225 (Rescue Unit)…………………….…$       4,200.25

















TOTAL…………………………………$3,439,779.00
METRO NARCOTICS:
Fund 035………………………………………………...$  74,752.25

d. Ratification of Bond Payments
Mississippi Development Bank Promissory Notes 


Hancock Bank
   Ck# 030848 issued 9-25-2007   
Total
$74,340.89
$18,000,000 MS Development Bank Special Obligation Bonds

Trustmark Bank

Ck# 030861 issued 9-26-07


Total
$ 843,709.05


c. Request to Repay Interfund Loans




From:

EMA Grants Fund











$80,250.00




(044-000-149)




To:



General County Fund









$80,250.00




(001-000-054)

2.   Justice Court Report (Including Fiscal Year End Report)
September, 2007

Criminal Cases Filed – 114




State Assessments - $52,172.00



Civil Cases Filed – 540






  County General Fund - $110,531.90



Traffic Tickets Filed – 959

  Total Collections - $162,703.90

  
Total Cases Filed – 1,613





[image: image1.emf]DESOTO COUNTY JUSTICE COURT   2006 - 2007 FISCAL YEAR END REPORT       MONTH        COLLECTED       COUNTY MONEY       October 2006       $112,473.66       $73,115.10   November 2006     $ 88,824.35       $57,591.35   December 2006     $ 94,623.01       $62,555.52   January 2007       $102,801.27       $69,053. 79   February 2007       $115,007.61       $73,225.11   March 2007       $106,468.49       $67,264.99   April 2007       $100,623.30       $63,454.80   May 2007       $129,736.24       $82,391.24   June 2007       $134,592.18       $89,359.18   July 2007       $123,418.57       $81,728.57   August 2007       $121,526.04       $78,718.04   September 2007     $162,703.90       $110,531.90     TOTALS:       $1,392,798.62       $908,989.59     Criminal Cases Filed:  10,331     Civil Cases Filed:  4,198     Outstanding Fines 2006 - 2007: $96,629.78     93% Collection Rate     



3.  Approval of Bailiff Pay
Liz Medlin - $160.00

Joe Holmes - $160.00

Lee Hodge - $120.00
 

4.  Circuit Court Allowance - $7,387.00











5.  Publication of Board Proceedings – Approval of Publication of Board Proceedings according to Section 19-3-33 of the Mississippi Code.

6.  Sheriff’s Employee Report

Hires and terminations for pay periods ending:

09/15/2007

09/30/2007

HIRES: 

08/22/2007
Jeremy Henson 

08/22/2007
Terex Severin 

08/27/2007 
Walter Scott Jr. 

08/31/2007 
Sheila Bridgewater

09/04/2007 
Elton Graham 

09/04/2007 
Elizabeth Pool 

09/05/2007 
Michael Parker 

09/06/2007
Stanley Graham

09/06/2007
Ollie Spain 
7.  Making the State Tax Commission’s Approval for RCL Components Part of the Minutes
   9.  Making the MOU of DeSoto County and the Town of Walls Agreement to Transfer Property Part of the Minutes

10.  Department of Road Management



a. Road Report and Work Schedule



b. Road Bond Report – Revised After Consent Copies Sent
11.   Inventory Dispositions


a. Preliminary – Building and Grounds























































Location at
Asset #






Serial #







 Description





Reason for Disposal





Preliminary

31721







C257B10ED




 RCA 25” TV





Broken












Bldg & Gnds

b. Final

Asset #






Serial #







 Description



Reason for




Disposed
Location


































Disposal





of
By


at Final
(1.) EMS/Fire
30823
866SXG6954
Motorola Radio
Broken/Parts Only
Used for

Parts Only




5016
1135284
GE Walkie Talkie
Broken/Parts Only
Used for
Parts Only




5017
1135281
GE Wakie Talkie
Broken/Parts Only
Used for
Parts Only




31182
9600616058B
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only
Used for
Parts Only




11092
53002767
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




11089
53002763
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31177
950643303G
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




30537
690FSG0795
Motorola H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31174
940504820
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




11090
63001580
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only
Used for           Parts Only




11104
63002208
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31179
951047738G
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only
Used for
Parts Only




31173
940401178
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only
Used for          Parts Only




31898
940504977
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for         Parts Only




30538
690FSG0654
Motorola H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31170
930453791
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




11101
63002207
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31899
950643136G
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




11102
63002212
Uniden H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




30536
15E05216Q
Motorola H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31175
940504902
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31181
960615693B
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31178
951047141G
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31171
930453792
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31172
930758804
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




31176
940816058
Maxon H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




8075
751AUC0336X
Motorola H/H Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




5025
63001151
Uniden Mobile Radio
Broken/Parts Only         Used for
Parts Only




16187








7292110771H0011




Murray Push Mower


Broken







JB




  TreeSaver
12058








C8799










Johnson Boat Mower


Broken/Parts Only

    Used for 

  Parts Only
35383








N/A











Chemical Agent Detector
Expired








Non Inventory Item 

35465








N/A











Anthrax Tester





Expired









Non Inventory Item 

3337








N/A











Grass Catcher





Broken







JB




BFI


30217








N/A











Metal Detector





Broken







JB




5R


12057








N/A











Boat









Broken







Used for 

Parts




12056








N/A











Boat Trailer






Broken







Used for 

Parts





12058








N/A











Boar Motor






Broken







Used for 

Parts





9014








266834914







IBM Typewriter




Broken







JB




5R



16015








102727









100 Watt speaker




Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
33241








N/A











Alert Receiver





Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
5028








N/A











Davis Weather Wizard

Broken







JB




5R


30334








NTHNTH26290





Canon Copier





Broken







JB




5R


5008








MC41102A37






Davis Weather Wizard

Broken







JB




5R



12100








45008938








BearCat Scanner




Broken







JB




5R



11091








63001580








NAWAS Phone




Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
36689








11E2583M032A8




Netgear Switch





Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
30357








CW660









Sanyo CD Player




Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
8040








N/A











Microphone






Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
31985








N/A











GE Portable TV




Broken/disposed by personnelDisposed by Personnel
32431








S1936D









Switch Box






Non Inventory(under $500)
Non Inventory Item
38018








PKGBQB86F3B65




Palm Keyboard





Non Inventory Item




Non Inventory Item
8074








751AUC0335X





Motorola H/H Radio


Broken






Used for 

Parts Only




8082








751AUC0342X





Motorola H/H Radio


Broken






Used for 

Parts Only


30401








8D20934Y








Sharp Calculator




Broken










Disposed by Personnel





31227








9509132566B






Maxon Mobile Radio


Broken






Used for 

Parts Only



30341








N/A











Kenwood Repeater



Broken/parts only


Used for 

Parts




30028








C7515










Aim Gas Detector



Broken










Disposed by Personnel
30338








N/A











Canon calculator




Broken










Disposed by Personnel
30352








N/A











Impulse sealer





Broken










Disposed by Personnel
30563








10500529








Maxon HH radio




Broken







Used for 

Parts Only




31282








2031914









Canon Calculator




Broken







Disposed by Personnel


8090








44692










Anacom tape deck



Broken







Traded in for Upgrade
36544








00w4a1c55hn2






Palm Zire







Broken







Disposed by Personnel




36543








00w4a1c45yv3






Palm Zire







Broken







Disposed by Personnel




38018








Pkgb1b86f3b65





Palm keyboard





Broken







Disposed by Personnel

(2.) IT Dept.

	Asset #
	Serial #
	Description
	Reason for Disposal
	Disposed

Of By 
	Location of

Final Disposal

	30695
	N/A
	Salta Phone System
	Outdated
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31443
	ENT8B02124697
	Netgear HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31470
	SACCN244B1
	Baystack HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31763
	0100LT3G126426
	3COM HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31764
	0100LT3G127044
	3COM HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31765
	0100LT3G126778
	3COM HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31787
	EF0049280
	Avocent Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31796
	1633189
	Transition Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	31797
	1613099
	Transition Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	32147
	SG01344671
	HP Jet Direct
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	32555
	ENT4C29872951
	Netgear HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33392
	013385763
	Lacie Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33400
	DS14139DB073282
	Netgear HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33419
	HCMCFS5033500121
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33420
	HCMCFS5033500126
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33421
	HCMCFS5033500124
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33427
	013385577
	Lacie Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Trade In
	Non-Inventory

	33469
	03360718590
	Lexmark Printer
	broken
	M.J.T.
	5R

	33477
	WMAES1543014
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33478
	WMAES1582806
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33479
	WMAES1662549
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33489
	HCMCFS5034700349
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33492
	HCMCFS5034700347
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33494
	HCMCFS8034900979
	Hawking Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33503
	R672041000066EH1089BB
	Linksys HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33533
	05420060AA0032
	ATEN VGA Extender
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33539
	WCAES1175465
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33540
	WCAES1172920
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33549
	100094030
	EzMaker Pro
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	33550
	43C2100423
	Startech HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35154
	A81MC53E
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35155
	A81N5Z2E
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35165
	R913045008257EB1040MA
	Linksys Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35166
	R913045008261EB1040MA
	Linksys Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35184
	T133400221
	Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35185
	T133802808
	Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35581
	N/A
	Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35671
	GS19147DB009974
	Netgear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35677
	04410009361A5
	Trendware Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35684
	530583704700677
	Hiro Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35685
	530583704700553
	Hiro Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	35686
	530583704700186
	Hiro Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36516
	Z8510149AAG0003
	Iogear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36517
	DL0B14B001735
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36522
	B27U155000821
	Dlink Bridge
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36529
	B209454000331
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36530
	DR87155000455
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36534
	A01068S041100355B
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36535
	A01068S04110396B
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36564
	CN28Q1POBT
	HP 3820 Printer
	Broken
	M.J.T
	AWS

	36676
	L00E5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36677
	L00I5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36678
	L00D5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36679
	L00F5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36680
	L00G5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36681
	L00B5218E
	Fiber Convertor
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36684
	553200545ED22
	Acer 17” Mtr
	Broken
	M.J.T
	AWS

	36686
	11E2583C03283
	Netgear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36687
	11E2583K032A6
	Netgear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36688
	11E2583P032AA
	Netgear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36691
	DR87155001706
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36692
	DR87155001707
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36693
	DR87155001708
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36706
	0511057167
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36708
	20V05704810WD
	Belkin UPS
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36714
	0511052660
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36961
	5AC0400092
	Startech HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36962
	5AC0400094
	Startech HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36964
	57C2700045
	Startech HUB
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36965
	D083V021043055002142
	Fiber Converter
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36966
	D083V021043053000302
	Fiber Converter
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36967
	D083V021043055000144
	Fiber Converter
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36968
	D083V021043055000141
	Fiber Converter
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36969
	DR86158014943
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36972
	DR86158014945
	Dlink Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	36994
	0541018096
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37001
	Z85Z0043APN0497
	Iogear Switch
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37019
	N/A
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37020
	N/A
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37021
	N/A
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37022
	N/A
	Ext Hard Drive
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37080
	300G16500050
	Dlink Phone
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory

	37123
	70000019XA30021
	LOGEAR SWITCH
	Non-Inventory Item
	Non-Inventory
	Non-Inventory


(3.) Animal Shelter

	31914
	NA
	Olympus Recorder
	Lost/Affidavit attached
	Affidavit Attached
	Affidavit Attached

	38040
	155521
	Karcher Pressure Washer
	Broke, used for parts
	Broke, used for parts
	Broke, used for parts


(4.) County Court

	262
	163398
	Lanier Recorder
	Outdated
	JB
	5R

	214
	n/a
	Microphone DM1525
	Outdated
	JB
	5R

	215
	n/a
	Microphone DM1525
	Outdated
	JB
	5R

	216
	n/a
	Microphone DM1525
	Outdated
	JB
	5R

	9035
	162-002
	IBM Typewriter
	Not used
	JB
	5R


The motion passed by a vote as follows:







Supervisor Jessie Medlin----------------NO







Supervisor Eugene C. Thach------------YES




Supervisor Bill Russell-------------------YES




Supervisor Allen Latimer-----------------YES





Supervisor Tommy Lewis----------------YES

See Exhibit E
F.  OLD BUSINESS
G.  NEW BUSINESS
1. Tax Collector – Insolvency List
Tax Collector Joey Treadway presented the Insolvency List 
for FY 07
to the Board of Supervisors.  Mr. Treadway said that his office has turned the collections over to the Sheriff’s Office.  He said the three percent delinquent taxes will probably drop to one percent.  Mr. Treadway said all of the $498,708.24 in delinquent personal property taxes is for business.  He explained that we cannot sell those taxes.  He said the amount of delinquent taxes on mobile homes is down.  He said we went from 22% to 16% on uncollectible taxes on mobile homes and that was thanks to the contract employee.  
Supervisor Bill Russell asked if this tax loss is figured into the millage estimate.  County Administrator Michael Garriga said that millage estimates are based on a 95% collection rate.

Supervisor Russell asked if other counties use the same collection rate.  Mr. Garriga said that is standard in most counties.

In accordance with Section 27-49-1 of the Mississippi Code, Supervisor Jessie Medlin made the motion and Supervisor Tommy Lewis seconded the motion to make the 2007 Insolvency List part of the minutes.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit G.1 
2.  Accounting
a. Travel Advance

At the recommendation of the Comptroller, Supervisor Bill Russell made the motion and and Supervisor Allen Latimer seconded the motion to approve a travel advance for the Animal Services Department for Dontae Cooper to attend training in Nashville, from October 7, through October 12, 2007 in the amount of $276 requiring that upon his return he will ensure that he has receipts for all expenses and account for the funds awarded.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit G.2.a
b.  Claims Docket

Supervisor Jessie Medlin asked about the insurance claim for the helicopter.  Comptroller Tom Arnold said the helicopters are insured under a different policy than other county property.  He said this has always been the case.  
Stephanie Hanks of the Accounting Department presented the claims docket showing claims that need to be paid for various departments.

Supervisor Jessie Medlin asked how to partner with NRCS on the expense listed on page 102.  
Road Manager Russell Dorris said we are getting our money back on that project except for the county match.  Supervisor Medlin asked why that is not going through NRCS.  County Engineer Andy Swims said this one is done on a reimbursement basis because we did the engineering.

In accordance with Section 19-13-31 and Section 19-11-23 of the Mississippi Code 
 annotated, Supervisor Allen Latimer made the motion and Supervisor Eugene Thach seconded the motion to authorize the Chancery Clerk to pay the bills as presented by the Comptroller.  The motion passed by a vote as follows: 







Supervisor Jessie Medlin----------------NO







Supervisor Eugene C. Thach------------YES




Supervisor Bill Russell-------------------YES




Supervisor Allen Latimer-----------------YES





Supervisor Tommy Lewis----------------YES

See Exhibit G.2.b
3.  Grants Administration – AOP – Approval and Authorize Board President to Sign Contract with Turning Point Counseling and Consulting
County Administrator Michael Garriga said this is our yearly contract with Turning Point for counseling services for the Adolescent Offender Program.  He said the grant requires us to have a counselor on duty.  

Supervisor Jessie Medlin made the motion and Supervisor Allen Latimer seconded the motion to approve the contract between the DeSoto County Board of Supervisors and Turning Point Counseling and Consulting subject to revising the last paragraph according to the recommendations of the Board Attorney.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote. 
See Exhibit G.3

4.  Advertise for Bid – Lewisburg Fire Station

County Administrator Michael Garriga recommended going out to bid for construction of the Lewisburg Fire Station.  

Supervisor Eugene Thach asked how this building will be paid.  Mr. Garriga said it will be paid from money from the State Development Bank.

At the recommendation of the County Administrator, Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Allen Latimer seconded the motion to advertise for bids and authorize opening of the bids for the Lewisburg Fire Station.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.

5.  Board Attorney

a. Red Banks Road - Approval of Appraiser’s Invoice 

Supervisor Jessie Medlin made the motion and Supervisor Tommy Lewis seconded the motion to approve paying Gene Norwood, Appraiser, $800 for the appraisals on Red Banks Road.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.
b. Hernando Civic Center Agreement
Board Attorney Tony Nowak explained that the lease agreement with the Hernando Civic Center expires in December.  He asked if the Board wants to renew the agreement.  He suggested renewing the agreement for one year and seeking a local and private to allow the county to donate money and services to the Hernando Civic Center.  

At the recommendation of the Board Attorney, Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Jessie Medlin seconded the motion to approve the lease agreement by the DeSoto County Board of Supervisors for the Hernando Civic Center and to hire the Smith Phillips Mitchell Scott and Nowak Law Firm to draw up the lease agreement.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.
Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Bill Russell seconded the motion to authorize the Smith Phillips Mitchell Scott and Nowak Law Firm to write local and private legislation to allow DeSoto County to donate up to $30,000 each year to the Hernando Youth Sports and/or the organization responsible for the Hernando Civic Center or a combination of the two, whether in cash or in kind funding.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.

6.  Bids Under Advisement – Jail Food

Purchasing Director Jeannine Ruby said the food bid was requested by the Sheriff’s Department to cover a six month period.  She said additional items were included in this food bid to accommodate the needs of the Sheriff’s Department.  The bids were submitted as follows:

	ITEM
	SPECIFIED BID QUANTITY
	 Gordon's Foods 
	 Merchant's Company 
	 Hardins Sysco 
	 U.S. Foods 

	Fresh/Frozen
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Chicken Breast Patties
	90/3 oz.
	 $          28.35 
	 $          22.46 
	 $       32.76 
	 $      29.70 

	Buffet Ham
	2/20-24 lb. Avg.
	 $        102.24 
	 $          81.12 
	 $       77.23 
	 $      77.28 

	Diced Beef Stew Meat
	20 # Bulk
	 $          45.50 
	 $          59.50 
	 $       66.28 
	 $      54.40 

	Turkey Link Sausage
	10 Lb.
	 $          19.15 
	 $          16.29 
	 $       19.46 
	 $      19.36 

	Smoked Sausage, red casing
	10 lb
	 no bid 
	 $          18.90 
	 $       17.87 
	 $      16.75 

	Turkey Smoked Sausage
	10 Lb.
	 no bid 
	 $          15.39 
	 no bid 
	 $      14.40 

	Chicken Fried Beef Patties
	48/4 oz.
	 $          26.95 
	 $          15.90 
	 $       24.42 
	 $      24.96 

	Chicken Nuggets
	10 lb.
	 $          12.49 
	 $          13.33 
	 $       15.01 
	 $        5.27 

	Ham & Cheese Loaf
	4/8 lb.
	 $          53.67 
	 $          55.00 
	 $       53.07 
	 $      52.18 

	Bologna
	2/6 lb.
	 $          14.26 
	 $          14.64 
	 $       14.56 
	 $      16.08 

	Turkey – Rolled Bologna
	2/15-20 lb. Avg.
	 $          39.20 
	 $          44.98 
	 $       58.96 
	 no bid 

	Turkey – Whole Tom
	2/20-22 lb Avg.
	 $          45.76 
	 $          39.16 
	 $       47.26 
	 $      39.60 

	Turkey Franks
	4/5 lb.
	 $          19.95 
	 $          20.82 
	 $       19.24 
	 $      20.00 

	Beef Franks
	10 lb.
	 $          17.35 
	 $          24.35 
	 $       19.95 
	 $      22.64 

	(JUMBO) Chicken Drumsticks  
	96/3.5 oz
	 $          28.67 
	 $          34.59 
	 $       29.59 
	 $      33.37 

	Chicken Leg Quarters
	60/8.25 oz. Avg.
	 $          43.05 
	 $          45.50 
	 $       19.90 
	 $      16.40 

	Fat back Salt Pork
	15 lb. Avg.
	 $          32.22 
	 $          25.35 
	 no bid 
	 $      31.35 

	Ground Beef  80/20 +/-
	4/10 lb.
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 

	Bacon Ends
	1/15 lb.
	 $          22.20 
	 $          20.08 
	 $       22.35 
	 $      19.95 

	Whole Hog Sausage
	3/6# avg
	 $          27.33 
	 $          38.78 
	 $       30.38 
	 $      37.98 

	Un-breaded Catfish Fillets
	15/3.5 oz. Avg.
	 $          45.88 
	 $          51.05 
	 $       48.29 
	 $      50.55 

	French Fried Potato
	6/5 lb. 5/16"
	 $          13.95 
	 $          14.95 
	 $       14.94 
	 $      17.38 

	Whipped Topping
	12/16 oz
	 $          24.95 
	 $          26.25 
	 $       31.05 
	 $      25.93 

	Baking Hens
	6/5lbs Avg.
	 $          25.50 
	 $          29.10 
	 $       32.07 
	 $      27.00 

	Frozen Corn on Cob                 
	          96/3"
	 $          14.95 
	 $          16.85 
	 $       17.35 
	 $      18.48 

	Frozen Broccoli
	12/32 oz. bags
	 $          22.75 
	 $          18.35 
	 $       13.32 
	 $      20.56 

	Frozen Okra (Raw/Breaded)
	20 lb.
	 $          14.95 
	 $          15.25 
	 $       15.35 
	 $      16.89 

	Cheddar Cheese (Block)
	1 cs (Avg 44-48 lbs)
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 

	American Cheese, Sliced
	4/5 lb.
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 

	Mozzarella Cheese, Shredded
	4/5 lb.
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 

	Eggs
	Large
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 
	 Market 

	Margarine
	30/1 lb.
	 $          13.95 
	 $          14.95 
	 $       14.74 
	 $      13.58 

	Pizza 4 x 6 (Cheese)
	96 ct
	 $          35.67 
	 $          39.89 
	 $       38.06 
	 $      35.82 

	Pizza 4 x 6 (Pepperoni)
	96 ct
	 $          35.84 
	 $          36.89 
	 $       37.34 
	 $      39.46 

	Baking
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Active Yeast
	12/2 lb. 
	 $          40.90 
	 $          47.95 
	 $       58.02 
	 $      46.96 

	Chicken  Gravy
	12/15 oz. pkg.
	 $          28.78 
	 $          44.77 
	 $       39.94 
	 $      37.80 

	White Pepper Gravy Mix
	6/1.5 lb. Bags
	 $          29.05 
	 $          10.98 
	 $       12.17 
	 $      13.85 

	Brown Gravy Mix
	12/15 oz. pkg.
	 $          29.05 
	 $          21.42 
	 $       34.12 
	 $      41.40 


	Self Rising Flour
	25 lb.
	 $            6.45 
	 $            7.35 
	 $         7.93 
	 $        6.77 

	Plain Flour
	50.lb.
	 $          14.10 
	 $          12.89 
	 $       13.63 
	 $      11.80 

	Self Rising Corn Meal
	25 lb.
	 $            8.05 
	 $            7.89 
	 $         7.04 
	 $        7.11 

	Sugar
	50 lb.
	 $          16.22 
	 $          17.25 
	 $       20.25 
	 $      18.01 

	Confectionery Sugar
	50 lb.
	 $          22.70 
	 $          21.69 
	 $       25.06 
	 $      22.91 

	Brown Sugar
	25 lb.
	 $          11.90 
	 $          12.05 
	 $       12.23 
	 $      11.67 

	Sweet & Low, Individual Packets
	2/1250 ct.
	 $          13.30 
	 $          18.50 
	 $       16.50 
	 $      17.75 

	Cake Mix, Yellow
	6/5 lb.
	 $          18.25 
	 $          19.69 
	 $       24.53 
	 $      18.92 

	Cake Mix, Chocolate
	6/5 lb.
	 $          19.79 
	 $          19.89 
	 $       25.85 
	 $      23.97 

	Pancake Mix
	6/5 lb.
	 $          20.27 
	 $          16.39 
	 $       16.38 
	 $      14.79 

	Salt, Iodized Granulated
	24/26 oz.
	 $            8.52 
	 $            9.39 
	 $         9.43 
	 $        9.58 

	Pepper, Black Ground
	5 lb.
	 $          34.25 
	 $          17.19 
	 $       31.88 
	 $      22.34 

	Baking Soda
	24/1 lb.
	 $          10.44 
	 $          10.98 
	 $       15.09 
	 $      10.17 

	Baking Powder
	4/5 lb.
	 $          26.60 
	 $          11.80 
	 $       26.91 
	 $      56.60 

	Spice – Nutmeg
	16 oz.
	 $            8.75 
	 $            9.57 
	 $       11.45 
	 $      10.92 

	Spice – Lemon Pepper
	27 oz.
	 $            7.30 
	 $            8.79 
	 $         8.37 
	 $        8.27 

	Spice – Cinnamon
	5 lb.
	 $          19.60 
	 $          22.38 
	 $       17.80 
	 $      26.20 

	Spice – Season Salt
	2/5 lb.
	 $          23.30 
	 $          14.55 
	 $       21.20 
	 $      18.00 

	Spice – Pepper
	6/1000 ct. pkg.
	 $          18.60 
	 $          17.40 
	 $       14.28 
	 $      17.56 

	Spice – Salt
	6/1000 ct. pkg.
	 $            9.75 
	 $          11.30 
	 $         7.74 
	 $        9.96 

	Spice – Paprika
	16 oz.
	 $            5.75 
	 $            5.75 
	 $         4.05 
	 $        3.68 

	Spice Italian Seasoning
	6 oz.
	 $            4.70 
	 $            4.75 
	 $         5.87 
	 $        4.02 

	Spice – Garlic Powder
	21 oz.
	 $            6.20 
	 $            5.47 
	 $         5.16 
	 $        6.95 

	Spice – Chili Powder
	16 oz.
	 $            6.26 
	 $            5.60 
	 $         3.78 
	 $        5.45 

	Spaghetti Seasoning Sauce Mix
	12/15 oz. pkg.
	 $          39.12 
	 $          42.39 
	 $       57.06 
	 $      54.76 

	Spice – Sage
	6 oz.
	 $            5.60 
	 $            6.05 
	 $         7.35 
	 $        6.99 

	Spice-  Ground Cumin
	15 oz.
	 $            5.80 
	 $            1.86 
	 $         4.20 
	 $        7.92 

	Spice- Ground Oregano
	12 oz.
	 $            4.45 
	 $            5.02 
	 $         7.31 
	 $        6.99 

	Taco Seasoning
	6/9 oz.
	 $          16.30 
	 $            7.49 
	 $       10.11 
	 $        9.41 

	             Accent Seasoning
	10 lb.
	 $          43.25 
	 $          36.25 
	 $       36.38 
	 $      34.91 

	Spice- Basil
	12 oz.
	 $            6.80 
	 $            7.32 
	 $         8.82 
	 $        8.46 

	Poultry Seasoning
	10 oz.
	 $            5.25 
	 $            4.78 
	 $         6.97 
	 $        6.63 

	Cocoa  Powder
	6/5 lb.
	 $          63.40 
	 $          44.50 
	 $       83.35 
	 $      53.26 

	Spice – Celery Salt
	32 oz.
	 $            4.25 
	 $            3.97 
	 $         5.26 
	 $        5.10 

	Flavoring – Vanilla
	32 oz.
	 $            3.85 
	 $            5.62 
	 $         3.68 
	 $        3.92 

	     Flavoring – Pure Lemon 
	32 oz.
	 $          11.65 
	 $            3.18 
	 $       16.62 
	 $        8.16 

	Condensed Milk
	24/14 oz.
	 $          39.95 
	 $          52.49 
	 $       52.08 
	 $      41.41 

	Vinegar, White
	6/1 gal.
	 $          12.65 
	 $          12.89 
	 $         9.35 
	 $      16.67 

	Chili Seasoning Mix
	6/5.7 oz.
	 $          15.40 
	 $          13.59 
	 $       14.49 
	 $      14.76 

	Crushed Red Pepper
	12oz.
	 $            4.55 
	 $            2.75 
	 $         4.68 
	 $        5.34 

	Beverages
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Regular Ground Coffee
	24/12 oz.
	 $          54.54 
	 $          70.75 
	 $       72.62 
	 $      96.38 

	Iced Tea Bags without Tape
	96/1 oz.
	 $          11.88 
	 $          11.39 
	 $       13.36 
	 $      13.57 

	Powdered Beverage w/Vitamins Lemon  
	12/22 oz.
	 $          12.91 
	 $          17.16 
	 $       15.63 
	 $      17.27 

	Powdered Beverage w/Vitamins Orange
	12/22 oz.
	 $          12.91 
	 $          18.06 
	 $       15.63 
	 $      17.27 

	Powdered Beverage w/Vitamins Fruit Punch 
	12/22 oz.
	 $          12.91 
	 $          18.06 
	 $       15.63 
	 $      17.27 

	Powdered Beverage w/Vitamins  Strawberry
	12/22 oz.
	 $          12.91 
	 $          18.06 
	 $       15.63 
	 no bid 

	Gatorade/ Fruit  Punch 
	24/20 oz.
	 $          17.05 
	 $          19.95 
	 $       16.25 
	 $      18.82 

	Cereals
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Quick Oatmeal
	12/42 oz.
	 $          20.50 
	 $          20.59 
	 $       26.40 
	 $      24.41 

	Hominy Quick Grits
	8/5 lb.
	 $          19.75 
	 $          16.49 
	 $       12.32 
	 $      15.09 

	Frosted Flakes
	4/35 oz.
	 $          12.12 
	 $          11.69 
	 $       28.29 
	 $      28.24 

	Corn Flakes
	4/35 oz
	 $          11.10 
	 $          10.05 
	 $         9.02 
	 $        9.30 

	Raisin Bran
	4/35 oz
	 $          13.85 
	 $          12.45 
	 $       11.55 
	 $      11.69 

	Fruit Whirls
	4/35 oz.
	 $          14.41 
	 $          13.75 
	 no bid 
	 $      12.99 

	Cheerios
	4/29 oz
	 $          27.95 
	 $          31.49 
	 $       30.21 
	 $      29.58 

	Toasted Oats
	4/35 oz.
	 $          13.25 
	 $          12.25 
	 $       11.11 
	 $      11.20 

	Condiments
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Non-Dairy Creamer
	1000/2.8 gram
	 $          13.99 
	 $          16.49 
	 $       12.87 
	 $      14.50 

	Assorted Jelly
	6/10 oz. can
	 $          32.00 
	 $          22.95 
	 $       27.89 
	 $      35.33 

	BBQ Sauce - Jars, not cans
	5 Gallon
	 $          26.12 
	 $          46.19 
	 $       32.87 
	 $      43.28 

	Hot Sauce
	24/6 oz.
	 $          13.73 
	 $          10.87 
	 $       12.79 
	 $      11.85 

	Spaghetti Sauce
	6/#10 
	 $          19.05 
	 $          21.25 
	 $       27.81 
	 $      21.78 

	Mayonnaise
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          20.78 
	 $          17.45 
	 $       19.03 
	 $      15.52 

	Mayonnaise, Individual Packets
	500/12 gr
	 $          25.65 
	 $          14.15 
	 $       34.03 
	 $      18.75 

	Mustard
	6/1 gal.
	 $          13.82 
	 $          16.44 
	 $       15.32 
	 $      13.85 

	Mustard, Individual Packets
	1000/5.5 grams
	 $          17.10 
	 $            9.38 
	 $       19.37 
	 $      12.76 

	Ketchup, Individual Packets
	1000/7 grams
	 $          17.65 
	 $          10.80 
	 $       21.55 
	 $      14.49 

	Ketchup, canned
	6/#10 
	 $          15.25 
	 $          16.65 
	 $       16.69 
	 $      15.29 

	Diced pimento
	24/24oz or 1.5# can
	 $          34.75 
	 $          35.88 
	 $       41.19 
	 $      42.16 

	Tomato Sauce
	6/#10
	 $          12.95 
	 $          16.89 
	 $       15.41 
	 $      14.18 

	Pancake Syrup
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          17.10 
	 $          14.35 
	 $       22.00 
	 $      15.50 

	Pepperoncini
	4/1 gal.
	 $          17.95 
	 $          15.47 
	 $       26.45 
	 $      20.83 

	Sweet Gherkin Pickles, Midget
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          32.95 
	 $          34.89 
	 $       57.36 
	 $      41.53 

	Peanut Butter
	6/5 lb.
	 $          37.25 
	 $          28.95 
	 $       36.90 
	 $      34.57 

	Tomato Paste
	6/#10 can
	 $          24.95 
	 $          28.75 
	 $       27.75 
	 $      26.24 

	Salad Dressing
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          15.17 
	 $          19.59 
	 $       19.67 
	 $      18.58 

	Jellied Cranberry Sauce
	6/#10 
	 $          31.75 
	 $          34.29 
	 $       31.75 
	 $      33.55 

	Karo
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          20.50 
	 $          15.59 
	 $       24.43 
	 $      46.11 

	Chocolate chips
	4/4 lb.
	 $          36.10 
	 $          15.97 
	 $       20.32 
	 $      22.36 

	Marshmallows
	12/1 lb.
	 $          15.45 
	 $          11.98 
	 $       15.28 
	 $      15.13 

	Worcestershire Sauce
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          23.95 
	 $          11.19 
	 $       22.66 
	 $      15.00 

	Flavored Gelatin
	12/24 oz.
	 $          20.95 
	 $          17.59 
	 $       18.57 
	 $      20.72 

	Citrus Gelatin
	12/24 oz.
	 $          20.95 
	 $          17.59 
	 $       18.57 
	 $      22.59 

	Chocolate Instant  Pudding
	12/28 oz
	 $          20.95 
	 $          21.71 
	 $       24.04 
	 $      25.91 

	Banana Instant Pudding
	12/ 24 oz.
	 $          20.95 
	 $          21.75 
	 $       40.28 
	 $      22.18 

	Jalapeño Peppers
	4/1 gal.
	 $          26.50 
	 $          19.59 
	 $       28.16 
	 $      25.76 

	Sliced Dill Pickles
	5 Gallon
	 $          16.50 
	 $          14.95 
	 $       17.12 
	 $      15.90 

	Sweet Pickle Relish
	4/1 Gallon
	 $          19.80 
	 $          20.19 
	 $       22.80 
	 $      20.41 

	3 in 1  Cheese Sauce
	8/32 oz.
	 $          45.25 
	 $          48.25 
	 $       46.68 
	 $      47.76 

	Ranch Dressing
	4/1 gal per cases
	 $          28.30 
	 $          26.09 
	 $       33.82 
	 $      32.21 

	       Sloppy Joe (Manwich)
	4/#10 can
	 $          19.78 
	 $          21.49 
	 $       21.19 
	 $      20.30 

	Cookies, Crackers, Pie Crust
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Vanilla Wafers
	5 lbs.
	 $            8.05 
	 $            8.59 
	 $         8.35 
	 $        8.13 

	Graham Crackers Honey
	200/2 pk.
	 $          16.50 
	 $          17.35 
	 $       16.26 
	 $      16.32 

	Saltine Crackers
	500/2 Ct.
	 $          11.74 
	 $          11.69 
	 $       10.72 
	 $      10.73 

	Graham Cracker Crust
	24/9"
	 $          25.95 
	 $          30.58 
	 $       26.03 
	 $      25.66 

	Pie Crust, Regular
	18/9"
	 $          11.32 
	 $          17.42 
	 $       17.41 
	 $      17.04 

	Pie Crust, Deep Dish
	18/9"
	 $          12.20 
	 $          17.42 
	 $       12.37 
	 $      18.04 

	Potato Chips 
	6/ 20oz.
	 $          11.90 
	 $          13.67 
	 $       13.34 
	 $      12.85 

	                     Tortilla Chips                              
	5/1.5#
	 $            8.65 
	 $            6.62 
	 $         6.79 
	 $        8.15 

	Corn Chips
	8/1#
	 $          11.21 
	 $          11.79 
	 $       11.54 
	 $      11.13 

	Ruffles/Wavy Potato Chips
	6/20 oz.
	 $          12.33 
	 $          13.29 
	 $       13.17 
	 $      12.74 

	Fish, Canned
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Tuna, Chunk Light in Water
	6/66.5 oz.
	 $          36.50 
	 $          40.75 
	 $       41.17 
	 $      40.04 

	Salmon
	6/4#
	 $          61.20 
	 $          59.75 
	 $       57.57 
	 $      58.92 

	Fruits, Canned
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Pineapple Slices
	6/#10
	 $          23.25 
	 $          24.95 
	 $       23.25 
	 $      27.45 

	Sliced Peaches
	6/#10
	 $          24.95 
	 $          26.95 
	 $       27.21 
	 $      26.40 

	                    Sliced Apples
	6/#10
	 $          19.75 
	 $          22.75 
	 $       24.46 
	 $      26.25 

	Fruit Cocktail
	6/#10
	 $          28.95 
	 $          29.95 
	 $       32.80 
	 $      31.35 

	Grains
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Elbow Macaroni Noodles, Large
	20 lb.
	 $            8.45 
	 $            9.39 
	 $       10.75 
	 $        9.35 

	Rice
	25 lb.
	 $          14.05 
	 $            7.42 
	 $       14.45 
	 $      10.03 

	Spaghetti Noodles
	20 lb.
	 $          13.59 
	 $            9.39 
	 $       10.26 
	 $        9.24 

	Egg noodles Wide 1/2"
	10 lb.
	 $            9.20 
	 $          10.28 
	 $         7.07 
	 $        9.67 

	Dry Baby Lima Beans
	3/10 lb.
	 $          21.50 
	 $          23.58 
	 $       26.03 
	 $      37.54 

	Dry Black-eye Peas
	3/10 lb.
	 $          21.70 
	 $          23.75 
	 $       25.77 
	 $      31.26 

	Dry Great Northern Beans
	3/10 lb.
	 $          15.95 
	 $          19.02 
	 $       20.75 
	 $      23.04 

	Dry Pinto Beans
	3/10 lb.
	 $          15.50 
	 $          14.27 
	 $       21.57 
	 $      13.10 

	Juice
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Tomato Juice
	12/46 oz.
	 $          13.07 
	 $          13.75 
	 $       14.50 
	 $      12.26 

	Lemon Juice
	12/32 oz
	 $          14.40 
	 $          30.34 
	 $       15.63 
	 $      16.88 

	Apple Juice, Small Cans
	48/6 oz.
	 $          16.48 
	 $          16.19 
	 $       15.67 
	 $      15.50 

	Soups
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Chicken Base, Granulated
	12/1 lb.
	 $          30.95 
	 $          14.19 
	 $       19.95 
	 $      19.58 

	Cream of Chicken Soup
	12/50 oz.
	 $          33.95 
	 $          37.49 
	 $       37.27 
	 $      33.06 

	Chicken Noodle Soup
	12/50 oz.
	 $          30.75 
	 $          33.75 
	 $       33.53 
	 $      36.13 

	Cream of Mushroom Soup
	12/50 oz.
	 $          33.75 
	 $          37.21 
	 $       36.98 
	 $      34.34 

	Beef Base
	12/1 lbs.
	 $          29.57 
	 $          14.75 
	 $       20.73 
	 $      19.92 

	Vegetable Beef  Soup
	12/50 oz.
	 $          45.95 
	 $          50.10 
	 $       48.69 
	 $      40.96 

	Shortening
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Liquid Vegetable Frying Shortening
	5 Gallon/35 lbs
	 $          16.82 
	 $          18.75 
	 $       18.33 
	 $      18.36 

	Non Stick Cooking Spray
	6/17 oz.
	 $          18.05 
	 $          11.85 
	 $       16.44 
	 $      19.55 

	Canned Goods
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Instant Potatoes, Granulated
	6/#10
	 $          38.53 
	 $          43.95 
	 $       41.18 
	 $      41.43 

	Carrots, Sliced
	6/#10
	 $          13.95 
	 $          16.21 
	 $       15.85 
	 $      16.08 

	Turnip Greens
	6/#10
	 $          14.95 
	 $          17.45 
	 $       17.02 
	 $      17.34 

	Pork and Beans
	6/#10
	 $          13.95 
	 $          15.45 
	 $       16.58 
	 $      16.74 

	Cut Yams, Large Syrup Select
	6/#10
	 $          21.75 
	 $          21.59 
	 $       23.61 
	 $      24.68 

	Mixed Vegetables, Fancy
	6/#10
	 $          14.78 
	 $          18.45 
	 $       17.92 
	 $      17.05 

	June Peas
	6/#10
	 $          18.11 
	 $          21.25 
	 $       20.37 
	 $      20.86 

	Whole Kernel Corn
	6/#10
	 $          14.95 
	 $          18.99 
	 $       18.75 
	 $      16.85 

	Whole Tomatoes
	6/#10
	 $          12.36 
	 $          13.95 
	 $       15.31 
	 $      13.77 

	Tomatoes, Diced
	6/#10
	 $          14.50 
	 $          16.69 
	 $       16.32 
	 $      15.01 

	Cream Style Corn
	6/#10
	 $          18.37 
	 $          21.79 
	 $       22.38 
	 $      21.07 

	Cut Green Beans
	6/#10
	 $          15.36 
	 $          17.55 
	 $       17.08 
	 $      17.66 

	                      Lima Beans
	       6/#10
	 $          16.97 
	 $          18.09 
	 $       22.35 
	 $      20.81 

	Purple hull Peas
	6/#10
	 $          17.75 
	 $          17.75 
	 $       17.51 
	 $      18.06 

	Paper, Plastic, Etc.
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Foam Cups, 16 oz.
	1,000
	 $          28.18 
	 $          31.15 
	 $       30.58 
	 $      28.47 

	Foam Cups, 8 oz.
	1,000
	 $          14.08 
	 $          15.49 
	 $       15.07 
	 $      13.91 

	Foam Bowls, 12 oz.
	1000
	 $          29.07 
	 $          16.69 
	 $       45.70 
	 $      29.97 

	Film Wrap, 2000 ft. Roll
	18"
	 $          13.59 
	 $          14.55 
	 $       17.12 
	 $      18.29 

	Aluminum Foil, 500 ft. Roll
	18"
	 $          21.45 
	 $          23.19 
	 $       32.30 
	 $      25.44 

	Foam Plate, 3 CPT 10 1/4"
	500
	 $          28.91 
	 $          25.00 
	 $       55.86 
	 $      23.92 

	Sporks, Medium Weight White
	1,000 Bulk
	 $          10.49 
	 $          10.59 
	 $       17.64 
	 $      18.48 

	               Wax Paper Rolls
	12 bx/500 sheets/10"x10 3/4"
	 $          47.95 
	 $          50.49 
	 $       72.27 
	 $      47.61 

	Coffee Filter, 12 cup
	2/500 Count
	 $            6.17 
	 $            6.15 
	 $         7.51 
	 $        6.36 

	1 Gallon Size Zip Lock Bags
	250 count
	 $          14.33 
	 $          17.69 
	 $       53.49 
	 $      21.03 

	Chemical & Janitorial
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Stainless Steel Aerosol Polish
	6/16 oz.
	 $          19.26 
	 $          19.29 
	 $       21.45 
	 $      22.93 

	Thin Black Hairnets
	144 per cs.
	 $          12.39 
	 $          12.49 
	 $       12.85 
	 $      12.40 

	Oven Mitts
	2 PAIR
	 $            4.17 
	 $            4.97 
	 $       13.21 
	 $      13.02 

	Oven Cleaner
	6/18 OZ.
	 $          17.55 
	 $          18.59 
	 $       18.58 
	 $      19.88 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Cereal Asst. "in a Cup" Gen. Mills
	60/1.75oz
	 $          43.00 
	 $          45.69 
	 $       44.99 
	 $      44.19 

	Cereal Corn Flakes Bowl -Pack Hospitality
	96/.75 oz
	 $          16.59 
	 $          17.55 
	 $       29.11 
	 $      16.85 

	Cereal Crispy Rice Bowl-Hositality
	96/.75 oz
	 no bid 
	 $          17.55 
	 $       29.09 
	 no bid 

	Cereal Froot Loops i-Box Kelloggs
	70/.95 oz
	 $          27.08 
	 $          27.70 
	 $       27.76 
	 $      27.47 

	Cereal Frosted Flakes-1 box Kelloggs
	70 / 1.2 oz
	 $          27.08 
	 $          27.70 
	 $       27.76 
	 $      25.40 

	Cereal Frosted Flakes Bowl Hospitality
	96/ 1 oz
	 no bid 
	 $          17.55 
	 $       29.11 
	 $      16.85 

	Cereal Fruit Whirls Bowl Hospitality
	96/ .75 oz
	 no bid 
	 $          17.55 
	 $       20.12 
	 $      16.85 

	Cereal i-Box Asstorment Favorite
	72/ ind
	 $          32.13 
	 $          32.59 
	 $       32.70 
	 $      32.35 

	Cerela LF Granola W/ Raisins i-Box
	70/ 2.22 oz
	 $          31.94 
	 $          32.49 
	 $       32.60 
	 no bid 

	Cereal Raisin Bran Bowl Hospitality
	96/ 1.25 oz
	 $          18.05 
	 $          19.19 
	 $       20.12 
	 $      24.91 

	Cereal Raisin Bran I-box Kelloggs
	70/1.52 oz
	 $          27.04 
	 $          27.70 
	 $       27.76 
	 $      27.47 

	Cereal Sheredded Wheat Miniatures  I-Box 
	70/1.06 oz
	 $          29.44 
	 $          30.10 
	 $       30.24 
	 $      29.87 

	Cereal 'In a Cup' Corn Flakes
	60 / 1.5 oz
	 no bid 
	 $          42.39 
	 no bid 
	 no bid 

	Cereal ' In a Cup Asstorted Kellogg
	60 /1.5 oz.
	 $          44.75 
	 $          44.69 
	 $       44.98 
	 $      41.40 

	Cereal 'In a Cup' Wellness Assorted
	60/ 1.5 oz.
	 $          50.14 
	 $          50.59 
	 $       50.87 
	 $      53.10 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Fish Cod Rect Precooked    American Seafood
	44/ 3.6 oz.
	 $          17.86 
	 $          21.95 
	 $       32.61 
	 $      34.44 

	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	SUB TOTALS
	 
	 $      4,228.86 
	 $     4,338.71 
	 $   4,753.93 
	 $ 4,456.62 

	DIFFERENCE OF NO BID ITEMS
	 
	 $         (85.83)
	 $       (213.41)
	 $    (155.15)
	 $   (109.19)

	TOTAL AFTER NO BID DEDUCTIONS
	 
	 $      4,143.03 
	 $     4,125.30 
	 $   4,598.78 
	 $ 4,347.43 

	DIFFERENCE OF NO BID ITEMS BETWEEN LOWEST 3 BIDDERS
	 
	 $          46.63 
	 $          39.10 
	 
	 $      44.34 

	TOTAL AFTER NO BID DEDUCTIONS OF LOWEST 3 BIDDERS
	 
	 $      4,189.66 
	 $     4,164.40 
	 
	 $ 4,391.77 

	TOTAL NO BID BETWEEN 2 LOWEST BIDDERS
	 
	 $          39.20 
	 $          44.98 
	 
	 

	DIFFERENCE BETWEEN LOWEST 2 BIDDERS
	 
	 $      4,228.86 
	 $     4,209.38 
	 
	 

	RECOMMENDATION:
	Merchants
	 
	 
	 
	


 At the recommendation of the Purchasing Director Jeannine Ruby, Supervisor Allen Latimer made the motion and Supervisor Jessie Medlin seconded the motion to approve the bids from the Merchant’s Company for food in the DeSoto County Jail.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.      See Exhibit G.6
7.  Chancery Court – Approval of Allowance
On this date, the County Administrator, Michael Garriga, presented on behalf of the Chancery Court Clerk, W. E. Davis, an order of Allowances to the Board of Supervisors for the September 2007 term in the amount of $1,550.00.  Supervisor Eugene Thach made the motion and Supervisor Jessie Medlin seconded the motion to approve these payments, pursuant to Section 25-7-9 of the Mississippi Code of 1972, Annotated.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit G.7

8.  NACO – County Change a Light Campaign




Supervisor Tommy Lewis said the Change a Light, Change the World Campaign kicks off on October 3, 2007.  He said the program is asking people to change one light bulb with an energy efficient light bulb.  Supervisor Lewis recommended the Board adopting and pushing this effort.
Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Jessie Medlin seconded the motion for the Board of Supervisors to adopt the Change a Light, Change the World Campaign and request and advertise Desoto County residents to change at least one light bulb with an energy efficient light bulb.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.      See Exhibit G.8

9.  Belmor Subdivision Drainage

Board Attorney Tony Nowak excused himself from the meeting for this item of business.  

County Engineer Andy Swims presented a picture of water in the street in Belmor Subdivision in Section B.  Mr. Swims explained that the Engineering Department thinks that Lot 2 has an undersized pipe.  Mr. Swims said it is unclear how the under-sized pipe got installed.  He said the responsibility could potentially lie on the county or the developer.

Supervisor Tommy Lewis asked if there is any way to keep the water from coming across College Road.  Mr. Swims showed a map and explained that the design of the drainage in the subdivision would drain all of the water away.  He said there is not as much water coming across the road as you would think.

Supervisor Eugene Thach asked if this one culvert would fix the problem.  Road Manager Russell Dorris said it would help.
At the recommendation of the County Engineer and the Road Manager, Supervisor Tommy Lewis made the motion and Supervisor Eugene Thach seconded the motion to declare the drainage issue in Belmor Subdivision a hazard to the health and safety of the traveling public, and authorizing changing the culvert in the subdivision according to the request of the County Engineer.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit G.9
H.  EXECUTIVE SESSION

The executive session portion of these minutes is recorded under the portion of the minutes called 
"Executive Session".

I.  OTHER

1.  Subdivisions - Cypress Creek


Supervisor Jessie Medlin asked if the hauling is still going on in Cypress Creek Subdivision.  Road Manager Russell Dorris said they have not hauled in several days but he thinks they are not finished judging by the amount of dirt left on the property.  He said that Board Attorney Jody Neyman is getting with the judge on this day to extend the bond thirty more days.
 

Supervisor Medlin said the county needs to check on the appropriate action in this situation.  He said it is a shame when someone can haul over 100 loads daily and the county cannot stop it when it is tearing up county roads and endangering our citizens in the subdivision and on the roads.  

Mr. Dorris said the new Sheriff has agreed to give the Road Department the ability to enforce this type of situation.

2.  Park Funds – District 3

Supervisor Bill Russell reminded the Board of the request for funding from Volunteer Northwest Mississippi.  He reminded the Board that Volunteer Northwest Mississippi: 
1.) Works in cooperation with the Mississippi Commission for Volunteer Service in recruiting volunteers through 1800 volunteer.org.  These individuals are able to list their skills, talents, interests and hours they can work as they sign on;
2.) Provides an outlet for our nonprofits to post their volunteer opportunities on 1800volunteeer.org and is a “matching” system for finding volunteers;

3.) Provides quarterly volunteer management workshops for nonprofits;

4.) Provides a monthly email newsletter for updates on volunteer opportunities and also provide email ALERTS in time of a disaster;

5.) Works in cooperation with Desoto County Emergency Management Agency and Red Cross in time of disaster.  Volunteer Northwest Mississippi will be the “call center” as the need arises directing people to the proper authority for assistance;

6.) Is governed by the Board of the Community with an Advisory Council that works closely with the Volunteer Coordinator. The Advisory Council is representative of the entire county.

Supervisor Allen Latimer asked Emergency Services Directory Bobby Storey if he is comfortable with the arrangement.  Mr. Storey said Volunteer Northwest Mississippi understands that volunteers work under the supervision of the county when they are assigned to a county agency.  
Supervisor Bill Russell made the motion and Supervisor Tommy Lewis seconded the motion to authorize donations from the District 3 Park Fund as follows:




a. Horn Lake Parks - $5,000




b. Southaven Parks - $5,000




c. Town of Walls - $5,000

And to authorize a budget amendment from the District 3 Park Funds to Advertising  County Resources for donations to Volunteer Northwest Mississippi.
The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit I.3

4.  Juvenile Drug Court
County Court Judge Allen Couch introduced Sammy Webb who will be serving Desoto County as the Juvenile Drug Court Coordinator.  Judge Couch said that Desoto County is fortunate to have Mr. Webb associated with the program and with county government.  He said we look forward to expanding the program in Juvenile Drug Court.

Supervisor Jessie Medlin asked the County Administrator to draft a letter to the current temporary Juvenile Drug Court Coordinator Chris Sheley to thank him for his services during this time.

Supervisor Jessie Medlin made the motion and Supervisor Bill Russell seconded the motion to make the order appointing Sammy Webb as Juvenile Drug Court Coordinator part of the minutes.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.

Supervisor Jessie Medlin made the motion and Supervisor Tommy Lewis seconded the motion to authorize Sammy Webb to sign purchase requisitions for the Juvenile Drug Court.  The motion passed by a unanimous vote.     See Exhibit I.4
5.  Legislative Requests

Supervisor Jessie Medlin suggested adding that Desoto County would like to see a Level 3 hospital in Desoto County and a request to change the Certificate of Need process to the 2008 legislative requests.

Supervisor Allen Latimer made the motion and Supervisor Eugene Thach seconded the motion to recess the meeting until October 3, 2007 at 9:00 a.m.  
THIS the 1st day of October 2007, these minutes have been read and approved by the DeSoto
County Board of Supervisors.
          _________________________________

Bill Russell, President

DeSoto County Board of Supervisors


_______
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DESOTO COUNTY JUSTICE COURT


2006-2007 FISCAL YEAR END REPORT


MONTH 


COLLECTED 

COUNTY MONEY 


October 2006


$112,473.66


$73,115.10


November 2006

$ 88,824.35


$57,591.35


December 2006

$ 94,623.01


$62,555.52


January 2007


$102,801.27


$69,053.79


February 2007


$115,007.61


$73,225.11


March 2007


$106,468.49


$67,264.99


April 2007


$100,623.30


$63,454.80


May 2007


$129,736.24


$82,391.24


June 2007


$134,592.18


$89,359.18


July 2007


$123,418.57


$81,728.57


August 2007


$121,526.04


$78,718.04


September 2007

$162,703.90


$110,531.90


TOTALS:


$1,392,798.62


$908,989.59


Criminal Cases Filed:  10,331


Civil Cases Filed:  4,198


Outstanding Fines 2006-2007: $96,629.78


93% Collection Rate 



